

APPENDIX D
TRAINING SCHEDULE
5-Jul
WK-1

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	IN PROCESSING	CI	ADMIN:0900	SH	1,2,3,5	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	CI		MH	5,6	UTIL
12:00 - 16:00	4:00	IN PROCESSING	CI	ADMIN:0900	SH	1,2,3,4	UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	CI		MH		UTIL
17:00 - TBD		IN-HOUSE PROCEDURES	CI/SI	ADMIN:0900	SH	7	UTIL

NOTES:

1. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL USE THIS TIME TO DISTRIBUTE INSTRUCTIONAL MATERIALS, VALIDATE DI SCREENING AND TO INTRODUCE IN-HOUSE PROCEDURES
2. INSTRUCTORS VALIDATE STUDENT MEDICAL RECORDS, SDA CHECKLIST AND FINANCIAL WORKSHEET
3. ALL POVs WILL BE PROPERLY DOD-LICENSED TO INCLUDE CURRENT REGISTRATION, DRIVER'S IMPROVEMENT COURSE AND INSURANCE; ALL MOTORCYCLISTS MUST ADHERE TO DEPOT REGULATIONS AND HAVE CURRENT MOTORCYCLE SAFETY COURSE DOCUMENTATION
4. BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL MAKE LIASON WITH MR. WARD AT MIRAMAR FOR THE 5/8 MILE HIKES
PHONE 858-864-4438
5. STUDENTS WILL REPORT IN SERVICE UNIFORM "A" AND CHANGE INTO UTILITIES FOR PROCESSING
6. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR REQUEST FUNDS FOR 1STSGT SPOUSE BRIEF
7. IDENTIFY MARINES THAT RATE A BARRACKS ROOM AND HAVE EXECUTED PCA/S ORDERS, IN ORDER TO GET A ROOM AT THE PERMANENT PERSONNEL BARRACKS.
8. UNIFORM/BWT INSTRUCTOR ENSURE TO ISSUE OUT LINEN AND CANTEENS
GET UNIFORM SIZE / COLLECT PT SHIRT SIZES

TRAINING SCHEDULE

6-Jul

WK-1

T-1

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	CI		SH/MH		UTIL
7:00 - 8:00	1:00	DIRECTOR/1STSGT WELCOME ABOARD	STAFF	ADMIN:0900	CR-1	3	UTIL
8:00 - 10:00	2:00	IN PROCESSING	STAFF	ADMIN:0900	SH	1,2	UTIL
10:00 - 11:00	1:00	RTR CO/SGTMAJ WELCOME ABOARD	STAFF	ADMIN:0904	CR-1	3	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	ACADEMICS BRIEF	AC	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	4	UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6	UTIL
13:00 - 15:00	2:00	PHILOSOPHY OF COMBAT CONDITIONING	PT	CC:0102	CR-1	5	UTIL
15:00 - 16:00	1:00	INTRODUCTION TO TEACHBACKS	DM	COD:0002LP	CR-1/PD	5	UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:00 - 19:00	2:00	INITIAL COUNSELING	SI	LEAD:0401	SH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. URINALYSIS, TATTOO SCREENING, VEHICLE INSPECTIONS INCLUDING MOTORCYCLE PPE. COUNSELINGS WILL BE CONDUCTED
2. PT INSTRUCTOR WILL CONDUCT A HEIGHT AND WEIGHT ON ALL STUDENTS
3. STUDENT WILL HAVE NOTE TAKING MATERIAL FOR THIS BRIEF
4. THIS BRIEF WILL CONSIST OF ACADEMICS OVERVIEW OF WHAT WILL BE COVERED AND WHAT STUDENTS CAN EXPECT DURING THE COURSE
5. IRF
6. CHIEF INTRUCTOR SUBMIT CLASS ROSTER TO DEPOT SECURITY MANAGER TO VALIDATE STUDENTS WHO POSSESS A SECRET CLEARANCE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

7-Jul

WK-1

T-2

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	CI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	INTRO TO COMBAT CONDITIONING	PT	CC:0101LP	CR-1/SH	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	INTRO TO CONDUCT OF DRILL	DM	COD:0001	CR-1/PD	2	SVC C
11:00 - 11:30	0:30	GOV TRAVEL CARD	GTC	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	3	SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	INTRO TO DEPOT REGULATIONS	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-1	2,4	SVC C
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	INTRODUCTION TO GUIDON MANUAL	DM	COD:0005	CR-1/PD		SVC C
15:30 - 17:00	1:30	SWORD ISSUE	DM	COD:0001	ARMORY	5	SVC C
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:00 - 19:00	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	6	SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT INSTRUCTOR WILL REVIEW STRETCHING PROCEDURES AND HOW THE CONDUCT OF PT WILL BE EXECUTED TO INCLUDE A BRIEF ON HOW MAN DOWN DRILLS WILL BE CONDUCTED;
THE PT INSTRUCTOR WILL SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO THE ADMIN CHIEF FOR THE ANNUAL TRAINING COMPLETION OF PHYSICAL TRAINING, CODE (BE)
2. IRF
3. MRS KIRSTEN WILL BRIEF GOVERNMENT TRAVEL CARDS
4. SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL GIVE AN INTRODUCTORY OVERVIEW OF DEPOT REGULATIONS AS WELL AS AN INCENTIVE TRAINING (I.T.) BRIEF AS IT PERTAINS TO WHAT WILL BE REQUIRED OF THE STUDENTS DURING THE CYCLE
5. THE DRILL MASTER WILL ISSUE SWORDS, GUIDONS, AND RUBBER RIFLES
SIZE STUDENTS FOR BLACK BELTS AND ISSUE DRILL CARDS
6. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL UTILIZE THIS TIME TO SCREEN FOR NON-COMPLIANCE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

8-Jul

Wk-1

T-3

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:45 - 6:45	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	CI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:45 - 7:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 8:45	1:45	INITIAL PFT	PT	CC:0102	TA-11	1	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 10:30	1:30	UNIFORM REGULATIONS I	UNIF	GMS:0304	CR-1	2	SVC C
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	SPORTS MEDICINE BRIEF	CIV	ADMIN:0903	CR-1		SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NUTRITIONAL DISCIPLINE AWARENESS	CIV	CC:0103	CR-1	2,3	SVC C
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL			MH	4	SVC C
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	PX CALL	UNIF	SOP:0200	REC PX	5	SVC C
15:30 - 16:30	1:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	PD/SH		SVC C
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	TEACHBACK POA EVALUATION	DM/SI	COD:1002X (P)	PD/SH	6	SVC C
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:30 - 19:00	0:30	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1		SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: (INITIAL PFT)
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
PULLUPS, 3 MILE RUN, CRUNCHES
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, TOWELS
STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A DEMONSTRATION BY INSTRUCTORS
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. PT INSTRUCTOR WILL SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO ADMIN CHIEF FOR NUTRITION ANNUAL TRAINING COMPLETION, CODE (BG); NORMA MENDOZA 4-8913 WILL INSTRUCT THE NUTRITION CLASS
4. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL SUBMIT CLASS ROSTER TO THE SECURITY MANAGER CHIEF FOR COMPLETION OF SECURITY CODE (AJ) AND PERSONAL IDENTIFIABLE INFORMATION (PII) CONTACT MRS. TERRY
5. WITH THE UNIFORM INSTRUCTOR, THE STUDENTS WILL GO TO THE RECRUIT PX TO MAKE A PX CALL IF NEEDED, AND OBSERVE THE RECRUIT PX CALL PROCESS
6. THE STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THE POSITION OF ATTENTION TEACHBACK

TRAINING SCHEDULE

9-Jul

WK-1

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

10-Jul

WK-2

0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A
--------------	-------	-----------------	----	--	-------	--	-----

TRAINING SCHEDULE

11-Jul

WK-2

T-4

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	BASE TOUR RUN	PT	CC:0102	MCRD	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 10:00	1:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS I	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-1	2	UTIL
10:00 - 11:30	1:30	APPLY STRESS MANAGEMENT TECHNIQUES	CI/CIV	LEAD:0403	CR-1	2,3,4	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6	UTIL
12:30 - 14:00	1:30	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS II (1 of 2)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-1	2	UTIL
14:00 - 14:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
14:15 - 15:15	1:00	PCO COMBAT ISSUE	UNIF	ADMIN:0902	PCO	5	PT-2/1
15:15 - 15:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
15:30 - 16:00	0:30	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA		UTIL
16:00 - 17:30	1:30	UNIFORM REGULATIONS II	UNIF	GMS:0304	CR-1	2	UTIL
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:30 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. 4 MILE BASE TOUR RUN (CLASS FORMATION)
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
PT INSTRUCTOR WILL GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
2. IRF
3. THIS CLASS WILL BE GIVEN BY THE CHIEF INSTRUCTOR & MRS. TEXIER FROM BEHAVIORAL HEALTH SERVICES AT 4-1200
4. SUBMIT CLASS ROSTER TO THE ADMIN CHIEF FOR ANNUAL TRAINING COMPLETION OF STRESS MANAGEMENT (BH) AND HYPERTENSION EDUCATION AND CONTROL (BK)
5. STUDENTS WILL NEED THEIR ID CARD FOR ISSUE
6. BWT INSTRUCTOR GET FINALIZED STUDENT ROSTER FROM ADMIN CHIEF AND MAKE KILL CARDS FOR THE STAFF

TRAINING SCHEDULE

12-Jul

WK-2

T-5

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
4:30 - 6:00	1:30	INITIAL RO	SI	SOP:0200	RA	1	UTIL
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
7:00 - 8:30	1:30	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS II (2 of 2)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-1	2	UTIL
8:30 - 10:30	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		UTIL
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	CPAC I	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	3,4	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:30 - 14:30	2:00	INTRODUCTION TO SWORD MANUAL	DM	COD:0004	CR-1/PD	2,5	UTIL
14:30 - 16:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	PD		UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 - 19:30	2:00	MARINE CORPS CUSTOMS & COURTESIES	MCCS	GMS:0307	CR-1	2	UTIL

NOTES:

1. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL ESCORT THE STUDENTS TO OBSERVE RECRUIT TRAINING ACTIVITIES
THE TYPES OF ACTIVITIES WILL DEPEND ON EVENTS AND SOP INSTRUCTOR'S RECOMMENDATIONS
2. IRF
3. STUDENTS WILL FILL OUT 1351 PER DIEM DOCS, DATA SHEETS AND OTHER REQUIRED PAPERWORK
DURING THIS BRIEF; CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-8394
4. STUDENTS WILL HAVE NOTE TAKING MATERIAL
5. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE 1 HR LECTURE BY DM, 1 HR DEMONSTRATION OF SWORD MANUAL

TRAINING SCHEDULE

13-Jul

WK-2

T-6

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:15 - 9:45	2:30	CIRCUIT CRS/S&E RUN	PT	CC:0102	TA-9	1	PT-2/1
9:45 - 10:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
10:00 - 12:00	2:00	INTRODUCTION TO GUIDON MANUAL (CONT;)	DM	COD:0005	PD		UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
13:00 - 14:30	1:30	INSPECTION PREPARATION TECHNIQUES	UNIF	GMS:0310	CR-1	2	UTIL
14:30 - 16:30	2:00	MARINE CORPS HISTORY (1 of 3)	MCCS	GMS:0306	CR-1	2	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 - 19:30	2:00	INDOOR DRILL (MINI GRIND)	DM/SI	COD:0007	SH	3	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 CIRCUIT COURSE X 2, S&E SQUAD RUN (2.5 MILES)
 UPPER BODY DEVELOPMENT, AMMO CANS
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, & TOWELS
 DUTY SQUAD SET UP CIRCUIT COURSE
 PT INSTRUCTOR CONDUCT PUSIPU UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. STUDENTS WILL LEARN TO SET UP THE SQUAD BAY TO PERFORM INDOOR DRILL
 THE DM WILL INSTRUCT MANUAL OF ARMS

TRAINING SCHEDULE

14-Jul

WK-2

T-7

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-5/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-5/1
7:15 - 9:45	2:30	SPRINTS/LOG DRILLS/O' COURSE	PT	CC:0102	TA-8 TA-9	1	PT-5/1
9:45 - 10:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-5/1
10:00 - 12:00	2:00	CARDIO PULMONARY RESUSCITATION	CPRI	CPR:0700	CR-1	2,3	PT-2/1
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
13:00 - 15:00	2:00	CARDIO PULMONARY RESUSCITATION	CPRI	CPR:0700	CR-1	2,3	PT-2/1
15:00 - 17:00	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	PD		SVC C
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:00 - 19:30	1:30	UNIFORM INSPECTION I (DIGITAL)	DI	GMS:1301X (P)	PD	4	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 SPRINTS X 2, LOG DRILLS,O' COURSE X 1
 STUDENTS WILL EXECUTE BUDDY DRAG, FIREMAN'S CARRY
 0.5-MILE SQUAD RUN WILL BE EXECUTED AFTER DYNAMIC WARM UPS
 DUTY SQUAD WIPE DOWN THE O' COURSE
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, AED, ICE & TOWELS
 PT INSTRUCTOR CONDUCT PUSIPU UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A DEMONSTRATION BY STUDENTS
 STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED OVER THE O' COURSE FOR MASTERY
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. APPLY CPR CLASS WILL BE VIDEO, DEMONSTRATION, AND CLASSROOM PRACTICAL APPLICATION
3. FIRST RESPONDER DRILLS ARE TO BE PRACTICED FROM THIS T-DAY FORWARD
4. THE UNIFORM INSTRUCTOR WILL BRIEF THE STUDENTS ON HOW THEY ARE EXPECTED TO PREPARE FOR UNIFORM INSPECTIONS AND THE STUDENTS WILL CONDUCT AN INSPECTION AT THE SQUAD LEVEL

TRAINING SCHEDULE

15-Jul

WK-2

T-8

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-3/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-3/1
7:15 - 9:45	2:30	O'CRS/CONFIDENCE CRS	PT	CC:0102	TA-5	1	PT-3/1
9:45 - 10:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		SVC C
10:00 - 10:30	0:30	DMO I	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	SVC C
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	UNIFORM CODE OF MILITARY JUSTICE (UCMJ)	MCCS	GMS:0302	CR-1	3	SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
12:30 - 14:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM	COD:0006	PD		SVC C
14:30 - 16:00	1:30	TEACHBACK BLOCK I	DM/SI	COD:1002X (P)	PD/SH		SVC C
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1	4	SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
OBSTACLE COURSE & CONFIDENCE COURSE
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE LOADED W/(2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A DEMONSTRATION BY DUTY SQD/
STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED OVER THE CONFIDENCE COURSE FOR MASTERY
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. DMO WILL BRIEF STUDENTS ON REQUIREMENTS FOR AN EASIER TRANSITION;CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-5369
3. IRF
4. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CASE STUDY INVESTIGATION BRIEF BY THE 1STSGT (LCPL ROTHER)

TRAINING SCHEDULE

16-Jul

WK-2

T-9

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:00	0:30	REV	DI		SH		UTIL
6:00 - 8:00	2:00	OBSERVATION OF INITIAL DRILL	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD	1	UTIL
8:00 - 9:00	1:00	MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. THE DRILL MASTER WILL ESCORT STUDENTS TO THE REVIEWING STAND IN ORDER TO OBSERVE INITIAL DRILL

17-Jul

WK-3

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

18-Jul

WK-3

T-10

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:15 - 8:45	1:30	SPRINTS/S&E RUN	PT	CC:0102	TA-9	1	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 10:00	1:00	MANAGE POTENTIAL SUICIDES	AD/CIV	LEAD:0402	CR-1	2,4	UTIL
10:00 - 11:00	1:00	MANAGE POTENTIAL SUICIDES (GD)	SI	LEAD:0402	SH	3	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6	UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	INTERIOR GUARD/DEADLY FORCE	MCCS	GMS:0303	CR-1	4	UTIL
13:00 - 14:30	1:30	EXECUTE GUIDON MANUAL	DM/SI	COD:1004X (P)	PD	5	UTIL
14:30 - 17:00	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:00 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 SPRINTS X 2
 S&E ABILITY GROUP (3.0 MILES)
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A DEMONSTRATION BY INSTRUCTORS
 END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. THIS CLASS WILL BE GIVEN BY THE ASSISTANT DIRECTOR & MRS. TEXIER FROM BEHAVIORAL HEALTH SERVICES 619-524-1200
3. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL CONDUCT A ONE HOUR GUIDED DISCUSSION ON MANAGING POTENTIAL SUICIDES AS IT APPLIES TO THE RECRUIT TRAINING ENVIRONMENT
4. IRF
5. STUDENTS AND STAFF WILL BE PRESENT FOR THE PRIORS GRADUATION CEREMONY IN CR-1
 GUIDON MANUAL WILL CONTINUE FOLLOWING GRADUATION
6. BWT INSTRUCTOR ENSURE SWERFT IS TRACKING ALL VEHICLE REQUEST FOR EACH HIKE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

19-Jul

WK-3

T-11

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
7:00 - 8:30	1:30	LAW OF LAND WARFARE CODE OF CONDUCT	MCCS	GMS:0305	CR-1	1	UTIL
8:30 - 9:30	1:00	UNIFORM INSPECTION II	STAFF	GMS:1301X (P)	PD	2	SVC C
9:30 - 11:30	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	(NEW) DRILL INSTRUCTOR PANEL	CI	SOP:0200	CR-1	3,4	UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	MARINE CORPS HISTORY (2 of 3)	MCCS	GMS:0306	CR-1	1	UTIL
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	PD		UTIL
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:30 - 20:00	1:30	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	5,6	UTIL

NOTES:

1. IRF
2. UNIFORM TO BE INSPECTED IS SERVICE "C" WITH NAME TAG
3. EACH RECRUIT TRAINING BATTALION WILL PROVIDE 2 NEW DRILL INSTRUCTORS
4. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL VERIFY WITH EACH TRAINING BATTALION THAT NOMINATED DRILL INSTRUCTORS HAVE BEEN INFORMED ABOUT THE PANEL
5. RESPECTIVE SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL MENTOR STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST
6. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL CONDUCT A 30 MINUTE GUIDED DISCUSSION ON LEADERSHIP (RIBBON CREEK)

TRAINING SCHEDULE

20-Jul

WK-3

T-12

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:15 - 9:15	2:00	1/4 MI INTERVALS/CIRCUIT CRS X 2	PT	CC:0102	TA-9	1	PT-2/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 10:30	1:00	ELEMENTS OF COMBAT	MCCS	GMS:0308	CR-1	2	UTIL
10:30 - 12:30	2:00	INTRODUCTION TO SWORD MANUAL (CONT;)	DM	COD:0004	PD		UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	4	UTIL
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	MARINE CORPS HISTORY (3 of 3)	MCCS	GMS:0306	CR-1	2	UTIL
15:30 - 16:30	1:00	COUNSELINGS AND EVALUATIONS	CI	LEAD:0405 (LP)	CR-1	2,3	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 - 19:30	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 1/4 MILE INTERVALS (8)/ CIRCUIT COURSE x 2, AMMO CAN LIFTS
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 DUTY SQUAD SET UP CIRCUIT COURSE
 PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. STUDENTS WILL GET BRIEFED IN AREAS PERTAINING TO: DRILL INSTRUCTOR BILLET DESCRIPTIONS, CYCLE EVALUATIONS , AWARDS, PUNITIVE AND NON-PUNITIVE ACTIONS
4. THE BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL MAKE LIASON WITH WFTBN S-3/S-4/WFTBN GUNNER FOR BWT WEEK.
 SUBMIT TSRS FOR ALL LOGISTICS INCLUDING RTO

TRAINING SCHEDULE

21-Jul

WK-3

T-13

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 5:45	0:45	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		MH		PT-2/1
5:45 - 6:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 8:30	2:30	COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL I	PT	CC:0105LP	POOL	1	PT-2/1
8:30 - 8:45	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:45	1:00	ANTI-TERRORISM/FORCE PROTECTION	MCCS	GMS:0301	CR-2	2,3	SVC C
9:45 - 11:30	1:45	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	BILLETING/HOUSING I	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-2	4,5	SVC C
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
13:30 - 15:00	1:30	UNIFORM INSPECTION III	UNIF	GMS:1301X (P)	PD	6	SVC B
15:00 - 17:00	2:00	USMC PACK SYSTEM BRIEF (PRAC APP)	BWT	SOP:0200	SH	7	PT-2/1
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:00 - 19:00	1:00	BASIC WARRIOR TRAINING (BWT) PREPARATION	BWT	SOP:0200	SH	8,9	PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: WATER SURVIVAL
SAFETY OFFICER IS REQUIRED FOR SWIM QUALIFICATION (E-6 OR ABOVE)
MAKE LIAISON WITH SWIM TANK CORPSMAN FOR SAFETY REQUIREMENT
BLOOD ROSTERS
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
IDENTIFY ON SWIM ROSTERS ALL STUDENTS THAT ARE INTERMEDIATE OR HIGHER (MCIWS)
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. SUBMIT ROSTER TO ADMIN FOR ANNUAL TRAINING REQUIREMENTS
4. THIS IS THE 1ST OF 2 HOUSING BRIEFS STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE; TOPICS FOR THIS BRIEF WILL BE QUALIFICATIONS FOR MILITARY HOUSING AND PROCESS IN SUBMITTING APPLICATIONS. MRS. WINFIELD AND MR. DUDLEY ARE THE POC; CONTACT NUMBER IS 619-556-9970
SPOUSES SIT WITH STUDENTS DURING THIS POI
5. NEW SPOUSES IN BRIEF IN CR-1 0930, UPON COMPLETION SPOUSES WILL SIT IN ON BILLETING/HOUSING
6. UNIFORM TO BE INSPECTED IS SERVICE "B" WITH NAME TAG
7. THIS PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION CONSISTS OF 1 HOUR PACK BRIEF AND 1 HOUR PRACTICAL APPLICATION
THE STUDENTS WILL LEARN THE BASIC CHARACTERISTICS OF THE USMC PACK AND HOW TO PROPERLY ADJUST IT FOR PROPER FIT
8. BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL COORDINATE THE 5-MILE HIKE AND WILL PREP STUDENTS FOR THE UPCOMING 5 MILE HIKE
9. ENSURE CORPSMAN IS CONTACTED AND NOTIFIED OF THE UOD AND TO ATTEND BRIEF FOR THE 5 MILE HIKE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

22-Jul

WK-3

T-14

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 6:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
6:00 - 6:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MIRAMAR	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
6:30 - 9:00	2:30	5-MILE CONDITIONING HIKE	STAFF	CC:0102	MIRAMAR	1,2	UTIL
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MCRD	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
9:30 - 11:00	1:30	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS III (1 of 2)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	3	SVC C
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
12:00 - 14:30	2:30	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	SA		SVC C
14:30 - 16:00	1:30	DELIVER A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION (LECTURE)	CI	TMI:0501	CR-1	3,4	SVC C
16:00 - 17:30	1:30	TEACHBACK BLOCK II	DM/SI	COD:1002X (P)	PD		SVC C
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:30 - 19:00	0:30	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1		SVC C

NOTES:

1. BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL GO OVER HIKE PROCEDURES FOR RUNNING THE DECK WHILE ON HIKES
2. SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: (1) CORPSMAN, (2) 4x4 VEHICLE LOADED W/(10) FIVE-GALLON WATER JUGS, ICE, AED AND RADIOS FOR THE DIRECTOR, CHIEF, BWT INSTRUCTOR AND ONE ON EACH TRUCK
UNIFORM FOR HIKE IS SEASONAL MARPAT UTILITIES
THE DIRECTOR WILL CONDUCT A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE HIKE EVENT
3. IRF
4. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL ISSUE TOPICS TO SQUAD INSTRUCTOR FOR PRACTICAL APPLICATION
IN "DELIVER A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION"; PERFORMANCE EXAMINATION TOPIC WILL NOT BE ISSUED
UNTIL THE DAY BEFORE THE EXAMINATION

TRAINING SCHEDULE
23-Jul
WK-3

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE
24-Jul
WK-4

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

25-Jul

WK-4

T-15

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-4/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-4/1
7:15 - 9:15	2:00	CCX	PT	CC:0102	TA-11	1	PT-4/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-4/1
9:30 - 11:00	1:30	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS III (2 of 2)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	2	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:00 - 14:30	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
14:30 - 15:30	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME (RECRUIT TRAINING CASE STUDY)	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	3	UTIL
15:30 - 16:30	1:00	MAGTF: MISSION AND ORGANIZATION OF USMC	AD	GMS:0309	CR-1	2	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	UNIFORM INSPECTION IV	SI	GMS:1301X (P)	PD	4	DB D
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:30 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 COMBAT CONDITIONING EXERCISE
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, AED, ICE AND TOWELS
 CORPSMAN
 PT INSTRUCTOR WILL GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A DEMONSTRATION BY DUTY SQUAD
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. THE PURPOSE OF THIS PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION IS TO INFORM STUDENTS ABOUT POSSIBLE CONSEQUENCES OF VIOLATING THE SOP
4. UNIFORM FOR INSPECTION IS DRESS BLUE "D" WITH RIBBONS AND BADGES (NO NAME TAGS)

TRAINING SCHEDULE

26-Jul

WK-4

T-16

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
7:00 - 8:30	1:30	DELIVER A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION (PRAC APP)	SI	TMI:0501	SH	1	UTIL
8:30 - 10:30	2:00	TROOP INFO	MCCS	GMS:0311	CR-1	2	UTIL
10:30 - 12:30	2:00	RECRUIT OBSERVATION (RO)	SI	SOP:0200	SA	3	UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
13:30 - 14:30	1:00	SAPR TRAINING	MCCS	GMS:0312	CR1	4,5	UTIL
14:30 - 16:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM	COD:0006	PD		UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 - 19:00	1:30	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	6	UTIL

NOTES:

1. STUDENTS WILL CONDUCT PRACTICAL APPLICATION IN DELIVERING A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION WITH THEIR SQUAD INSTRUCTOR
2. IRF
3. SQUAD INSTRUCTOR WILL USE THIS TIME TO TAKE THE STUDENTS TO THE RECRUIT TRAINING AREA AND OBSERVE RECRUIT TRAINING EVENTS
4. THIS CLASS WILL BE GIVEN BY THE INSTALLATION SARC ELLIE BENAVIDES OR REBECCA AX AT EXT: 3761/3762
5. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR ENSURE STUDENTS FILL OUT ATTENDANCE ROSTER AND TURN IT IN TO SUPPORT BATTALION
6. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL INSTRUCT STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE NEW DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST TO INCLUDE 'RUNNING THE DECK'

TRAINING SCHEDULE

27-Jul

WK-4

T-17

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:15 - 8:45	1:30	SPRINTS 30/60 3 MILE INTERVAL RUN	PT	CC:0102	TA-9	1	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
11:00 - 11:30	0:30	MCCS/GMS PRE-EXAM REVIEW	MCCS	GMS:1302X (W)	CR-2	2	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:30 - 14:30	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
14:30 - 15:30	1:00	REINFORCE CORE VALUES THRU VALUES BASED TRAINING (1)	VBT	LEAD:0407	CR-2	3	UTIL
15:30 - 16:30	1:00	RELOCATION ASSISTANCE	DI	MCCS	CR-1	4	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 - 19:00	1:30	DELIVER A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION (PRAC APP)	SI	TMI:0501	SA	5	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 30 SEC SPRINT/60 SEC RECOVER 3 MILE SQUAD INTERVAL RUN (ABILITY GROUP)
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/ (2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. THIS REVIEW IS TO PROVIDE AN OPPORTUNITY FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK QUESTIONS AND/OR REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION OR ELABORATION ON THE MCCS TESTABLE MATERIAL
3. IRF
4. THIS BRIEF WILL BE GIVEN MS. PERLITA RODRIGUEZ FROM RELOCATION ASSISTANCE OFFICE AT EXT:5298/5732
5. STUDENTS WILL CONDUCT PRACTICAL APPLICATION IN DELIVERING A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION WITH THEIR SQUAD INSTRUCTOR

TRAINING SCHEDULE

28-Jul

WK-4

T-18

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
4:45 - 5:45	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
5:45 - 6:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT/DI	ADMIN:0901	SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 8:15	2:15	COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL II	PT/DI	CC:0105LP	SWIM TANK	1	PT-2/1
8:15 - 8:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT/DI	ADMIN:0901	SH/MH		PT-2/1
8:30 - 9:30	1:00	DIRECTOR'S LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION I	DIR	LEAD:0401	CR-1	2	UTIL
9:30 - 11:30	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	SM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	MCCS/GMS EXAMINATION	MCCS	GMS:1302X (W)	CR-2	3, 4	PT-2/1
13:30 - 14:00	0:30	MCCS/GMS POST-EXAM REVIEW	MCCS	GMS:1302X (W)	CR-2		PT-2/1
14:00 - 16:30	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 - TBD	TBD	RECRUIT OBSERVATION (RO)	SOP/SI	SOP:0200	SH/RTR	5	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
SAFETY OFFICER IS REQUIRED FOR SWIM QUALIFICATION (E-6 OR ABOVE)
MAKE LIAISON WITH SWIM TANK CORPSMAN FOR SAFETY REQUIREMENT
BLOOD ROSTERS
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
ANY STUDENT NOT PARTICIPATING IN COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL SWIM WILL CONDUCT SWIM PT
IDENTIFY ON SWIM ROSTERS ALL STUDENTS THAT ARE INTERMEDIATE OR HIGHER (MCIWS)
- * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. SET UP CLASS IN A SEMI CIRCLE (HALF MOON) FOR DIRECTORS LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION
3. THIS REVIEW IS TO PROVIDE AN OPPORTUNITY FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK ANY QUESTIONS
AND/OR REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION OR ELABORATION ON MCCS TESTABLE MATERIAL
4. A STUDENT FROM EACH SQUAD WILL FILL OUT AN EXAMINATION RATING FORM UPON COMPLETION
OF THE EXAM
5. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL MAKE LIAISON WITH THE STAFF OF THE COMPANY THAT WILL BE
OBSERVED SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL ESCORT STUDENTS TO THE RECRUIT TRAINING AREA AND
OBSERVE RECRUIT TRAINING PROCEDURES. ENSURE THAT DI SCHOOL FIRST SERGEANT IS
INFORMED OF WHAT TRAINING COMPANY IS GOING TO BE OBSERVED

TRAINING SCHEDULE

29-Jul

WK-4

T-19

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:30	0:30	MOVEMENT PACIFIC BEACH	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:30 - 9:00	1:30	BOARDWALK RUN	PT	CC:0102	MISSION BEACH	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MCRD	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 10:30	1:00	CONDUCT MENTORING	CI	LEAD:0401	CR-1	2	SVC C
10:30 - 12:00	1:30	DELIVER A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION (PRAC APP)	SI	TMI:0501	SA	3	SVC C
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6	SVC C
13:00 - 15:30	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		SVC C
15:30 - 17:00	1:30	TEACHBACK BLOCK III	DM/SI	COD:1002X (P)	PD/SH	4	SVC C
17:00 - 17:30	0:30	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1	5	SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
PACIFIC BEACH/BOARDWALK RUN 4-MILE
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/ (2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. PERFORMANCE EVALUATION FOR DELIVERING A POI WILL BE GRADED BY SQUAD INSTRUCTORS AT THIS TIME
4. STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED ON TEACHBACK BLOCK III, THE STUDENTS THAT HAVE NOT COMPLETED BLOCK I, II, III **WILL BE COUNSELED BY THE DIRECTOR**
5. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CASE STUDY INVESTIGATION BRIEF BY THE 1STSGT (ALGRIM)
6. SQUAD PEER EVALS ARE TO BE TURNED IN THIS DAY TO SQD INSTRUCTORS

TRAINING SCHEDULE

30-Jul

WK-4

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

31-Jul

WK-5

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

1-Aug

WK-5

T-20

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH	4	PT-5/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-5/1
7:15 - 9:15	2:00	INITIAL CFT	PT	CC:0102	TA-11	1	PT-5/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-5/1
9:30 - 11:30	2:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS IV (1 of 4)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	2	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	REINFORCE CORE VALUES THRU VALUES BASED TRAINING (2)	VBT	LEAD:0407	CR-2	2	UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	3	UTIL
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:30 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: (CFT)
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 COMBAT FITNESS TEST
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL INSTRUCT STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE NEW
 DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST TO INCLUDE 'RUNNING THE DECK'
4. T-20 PRB WILL BE CONDUCTED TIME TBD

TRAINING SCHEDULE

2-Aug

WK-5

T-21

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:45 - 6:45	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:45 - 7:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 8:45	1:45	B.A.S.E.S. CLASS	PT/CIV	CC:0102	TA-1	1	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS IV (2 of 4)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	2	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	REINFORCE CORE VALUES THRU VALUES BASED TRAINING (GD)	SI	LEAD:0407	SA	3	UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6,7	UTIL
13:00 - 13:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
13:15 - 14:45	1:30	PCO II	UNIF	ADMIN: 0902	SH	4	UTIL
14:45 - 15:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
15:00 - 17:00	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:00 - 19:00	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	5	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: BASES CLASS
DYNAMIC 16, SPRINTS WORKOUT, BASES (MR. READING CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-1765)
UPPER BODY DEVELOPMENT
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL CONDUCT A 1 HOUR GUIDED DISCUSSION BASED ON VALUES BASED TRAINING SCENARIOS
4. UNIFORM INSTRUCTOR WILL COORDINATE WITH PCO FOR PICKING UP CAMPAIGN COVERS, DUTY BELTS, NAMETAPES, BLOOD STRIPES, AND CHEVRONS
5. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL CONDUCT A 30 MINUTE GUIDED DISCUSSION ON SEXUAL ASSAULT
6. PT INSTRUCTOR MAKE LIASON WITH CABRILLO MONUMENT FOR UPCOMING PT EVENT
POC OFFICER IS EMILY FLOYD (818) 522-1842
7. ENSURE CORPSMAN IS CONTACTED TO ATTEND MISSION BAY RUN BRIEF.

TRAINING SCHEDULE

3-Aug

WK-5

T-22

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:30 - 7:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	MISSION BAY PARK		PT-2/1
7:00 - 8:30	1:30	MISSION BAY PARK RUN	STAFF	CC:0102	MISSION BAY PARK	1	PT-2/1
8:30 - 9:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	2,4	UTIL
12:00 - 14:00	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
14:00 - 17:00	3:00	DELIVER A POI PERFORMANCE EXAMINATION	SI	TMI:1501X (P)	SA	3	UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
5-MILE SQUAD RUN
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
2. ENSURE CORPSMAN IS CONTACTED AND NOTIFIED OF THE UOD AND TO CONFIRM PRESENCE FOR THE 8 MILE HIKE & BRIEF FOR TOMORROW
3. PERFORMANCE EVALUATION FOR DELIVERING A POI WILL BE GRADED BY SQUAD INSTRUCTORS
4. ENSURE CORPSMAN IS CONTACTED FOR CABRILLO RUN ON T-29

TRAINING SCHEDULE

4-Aug

WK-5

T-23

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 5:45	0:45	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
5:45 - 6:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 8:45	2:45	COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL III	PT/DI	CC:0105LP	POOL	1	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 10:00	1:00	CPAC II	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	SVC C
10:00 - 11:00	1:00	MANAGE PROBLEM RECRUITS	CI	LEAD:0404	CR-1	3,4,5	SVC C
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	7,8	SVC C
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	MANAGE PROBLEM RECRUITS	CI	LEAD:0404	CR-1	5	SVC C
13:00 - 14:00	1:00	UNIFORM INSPECTION V	STAFF	GMS:1301X (P)	PD	6	DB C
14:00 - 15:30	1:30	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		SVC C
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		PT-2/1
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
SAFETY OFFICER IS REQUIRED FOR SWIM QUALIFICATION (E-6 OR ABOVE)
MAKE LIAISON WITH SWIM TANK CORPSMAN FOR SAFETY REQUIREMENT
BLOOD ROSTERS
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
ANY STUDENT NOT PARTICIPATING IN COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL SWIM WILL CONDUCT SWIM PT
IDENTIFY ON SWIM ROSTERS ALL STUDENTS THAT ARE INTERMEDIATE OR HIGHER (MCIWS)
- * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. FAMILY SEPARATION AND OTHER ADMIN TOPICS WILL BE COVERED DURING THIS BRIEF
3. IRF
4. THIS CLASS WILL BE TAUGHT UTILIZING THE LECTURE METHOD ALONG WITH A PANEL OF RECRUITS
5. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL VERIFY THAT A TOTAL OF 6 RECRUITS HAVE BEEN IDENTIFIED FOR THIS EVENT. RECRUITS WILL COME FROM ONE OF THE FOLLOWING SECTIONS; RSP, ELS, MRP, ELPAC, OR RAMPS. RECRUITS ARE ONLY NEEDED FOR THE 1200 CLASS
6. UNIFORM FOR INSPECTION WILL BE DRESS BLUE "C" WITH RIBBONS AND BADGES (NO NAME TAGS)
7. CONDUCT BRIEF FOR 8 MILE HIKE (09:00)
8. ENSURE CORPSMAN IS CONTACTED AND NOTIFIED OF THE UOD AND TO CONFIRM PRESENCE FOR THE 8 MILE HIKE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

5-Aug

WK-5

T-24

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 6:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
6:00 - 6:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MIRAMAR	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
6:30 - 9:30	3:00	8-MILE CONDITIONING HIKE	STAFF	CC:0102	MIRAMAR	1,2	UTIL
9:30 - 10:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MCRD	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
10:00 - 11:00	1:00	HIKE RECOVERY TIME	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	5	SVC C
12:00 - 14:00	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		SVC C
14:00 - 15:30	1:30	TEACHBACK BLOCK IV	DM/SI	COD:1003X (P)	PD/SH		SVC C
15:30 - 17:00	1:30	LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION (LECTURE)	VBT	TMI:0502	CR-2	3,4	SVC C
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:00 - 19:00	1:00	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1	6	SVC C

NOTES:

1. BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL LEAD THE 8-MILE HIKE
2. SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: (1) CORPSMAN, (2) 4x4 VEHICLE LOADED W/(10) FIVE-GALLON WATER JUGS, ICE, AED & (5) RADIOS FOR THE DIRECTOR, 1STSGT, CHIEF, BWT, TRUCK, THE SCHOOL 1STSGT WILL GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE HIKE EVENT
3. IRF
4. THE CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL ISSUE TOPICS TO SQUAD INSTRUCTOR FOR PRACTICAL APPLICATION IN "LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION"; PERFORMANCE EXAMINATION TOPIC WILL NOT BE ISSUED UNTIL THE DAY BEFORE THE EXAMINATION
5. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL VERIFY WITH EACH TRAINING BATTALION THAT NOMINATED SENIOR DRILL INSTRUCTORS HAVE BEEN INFORMED ABOUT THE PANEL
6. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CASE STUDY INVESTIGATION BRIEF BY THE COMPANY 1STSGT (GONZALEZ)

TRAINING SCHEDULE
6-Aug
WK-5

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE
7-Aug
WK-6

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

8-Aug

WK-6

T-25

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:45 - 6:45	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:45 - 7:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:15	2:15	INTERMEDIATE PFT	PT	CC:0102	TA-11	1	PT-2/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 10:30	1:00	SENIOR DRILL INSTRUCTOR PANEL	CI	LEAD:0401	CR-2		UTIL
10:30 - 11:00	0:30	LDRSHP PRE-EXAM REVIEW	LEAD	LEAD:1400X (W)	CR-2	2	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	5	UTIL
12:00 - 12:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
12:15 - 15:15	3:00	OP UNIFORM ISSUE	UNIF	ADMIN:0902	CLOTHING	3	PT-2/1
15:15 - 15:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	FIRST RESPONDER/CPR EVALUATION	CPRI	CPR:1701X (P)	CR-2	4	PT-2/1
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:30 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: (INTERMEDIATE PFT)
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 PULLUPS, 3 MILE RUN, CRUNCHES
 SAFETY REQUIRMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 STUDENTS WILL BE WEIGHED IN AND BODY COMPOSITIONS WILL BE TAKEN
 DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. THIS REVIEW IS TO PROVIDE AN OPPORTUNITY FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK ANY QUESTIONS
 AND/OR REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION OR ELABORATION ON LEADERSHIP TESTABLE MATERIAL
3. STUDENTS WILL HAVE A SEABAG, AN INK STICK AND SKIVVIES UNDER PT GEAR
 UNIFORM INSTRUCTOR WILL CALL CLOTHING TO ENSURE UNIFORMS ARE PREPARED FOR FITTING
 STUDENT WILL RECEIVE THEIR FIRST UNIFORM FITTING
4. STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED AND TESTED FOR QUALIFICATION OF CPR
5. BWT INSTRUCTOR SUBMIT TSR TO WFTBN

TRAINING SCHEDULE

9-Aug

WK-6

T-26

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 6:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
6:00 - 9:00	3:00	RECRUIT OBSERVATION (RO)	STAFF	SOP:0200	RTR	1	UTIL
9:00 - 10:00	1:00	LDRSHP EXAMINATION	LEAD	LEAD:1400X (W)	CR-2	2,3	PT-2/1
10:00 - 10:30	0:30	LDRSHP POST-EXAM REVIEW	LEAD	LEAD:1400X (W)	CR-2		PT-2/1
10:30 - 12:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	SA		UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS IV (3 of 4)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	4	UTIL
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	SA		UTIL
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. AT A MINIMUM, SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL ESCORT STUDENTS AND VISIT STC BRKS, MEDICAL, SATO, CLOTHING, PCO, DENTAL, MOTOR T, ARMORY & BN ROUTING SECTION IN ORDER TO BETTER UNDERSTAND THE RESPONSIBILITIES OF A NEW DRILL INSTRUCTOR IF THEY GO TO BN AREA'S NOTIFY DI SCHOOL 1STSGT FIRST
2. STUDENTS WILL BE SEATED IN CR-2 BY THE PRESCRIBED TIME WITH ONLY A FULL CANTEEN, INK STICK, LEAD STICK, AND MILITARY ID IN THEIR POSSESSION, STUDENTS WILL FILL OUT ERF
3. A STUDENT FROM EACH SQUAD WILL FILL OUT AN EXAMINATION RATING FORM UPON COMPLETION OF THE EXAM
4. IRF

TRAINING SCHEDULE

10-Aug

WK-6

T-27

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-5/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-5/1
7:15 - 9:45	2:30	RAPPELING/CONFIDENCE CRSE	PT	CC:0104LP	TA-4 TA-5	1	PT-5/1
9:45 - 10:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-5/1
10:00 - 12:00	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	2	UTIL
13:00 - 15:00	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	SA		UTIL
15:00 - 16:00	1:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS IV (4 of 4)	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	3	UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:00 - 19:00	2:00	LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION (PRAC APP)	DM/SI	TMI:0502	PD/SH	4	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 RAPPELLING
 CONFIDENCE COURSE (TIME PERMITTING AND FOR ANY STUDENTS WHO FAILED INITIAL ATTEMPTS)
 DUTY SQUAD SET UP COURSE
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE LOADED W/(2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, ICE, AED &
 TOWELS. PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL VERIFY WITH EACH TRAINING BATTALION THAT NOMINATED CHIEF DRILL
 INSTRUCTORS HAVE BEEN INFORMED ABOUT THE PANEL ON T-32
3. IRF
4. STUDENTS WILL CONDUCT PRACTICAL APPLICATION AND LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION
 WITH THEIR SQUAD INSTRUCTOR

TRAINING SCHEDULE

11-Aug

WK-6

T-28

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 5:45	0:45	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
5:45 - 6:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 8:15	2:15	COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL IV	PT/DI	CC:0105LP	POOL	1	PT-2/1
8:15 - 8:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
8:30 - 10:30	2:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS V (1 OF 2)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	2	SVC C
10:30 - 12:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		SVC C
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
13:30 - 15:30	2:00	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		SVC C
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION (PRAC APP)	DI	TMI:0502	MH	3	SVC C
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
SAFETY OFFICER IS REQUIRED FOR SWIM QUALIFICATION (E-6 OR ABOVE)
MAKE LIAISON WITH SWIM TANK CORPSMAN FOR SAFETY REQUIREMENT
BLOOD ROSTERS
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
ANY STUDENT NOT PARTICIPATING IN COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL SWIM WILL CONDUCT SWIM PT
IDENTIFY ON SWIM ROSTERS ALL STUDENTS THAT ARE INTERMEDIATE OR HIGHER (MCIWS)
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. IRF
3. STUDENTS WILL CONDUCT PRACTICAL APPLICATION AND LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION
WITH THEIR SQUAD INSTRUCTOR

TRAINING SCHEDULE

12-Aug

WK-6

T-29

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:30 - 7:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TO CABRILLO NATIONAL MONUMENT	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	CABRILLO RUN	PT	CC:0102	CABRILLO	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MCRD	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 11:30	2:00	APPLY DEPOT REGULATIONS V (2 OF 2)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	2	SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	DIRECTOR'S LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION II	DIR	LEAD:0401	CR-1	3	SVC C
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
13:30 - 15:00	1:30	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		SVC C
15:00 - 17:00	2:00	TEACHBACK BLOCK V	DM/SI	COD:1003X (P)	PD/SH		SVC C
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:00 - 19:00	1:00	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1	4	SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 5-MILE SQUAD RUN/INDIVIDUAL EFFORT RUN
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE LOADED W/(2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, AED & ICE
 DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
2. IRF
3. SET UP CLASS IN A SEMI HALF MOON SCHOOL CIRCLE FOR DIRECTORS LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION.
 DIRECTOR HAS A READ AHEAD FOR CLASS TO HAVE AND READ THE FIRST 15 MINUTES OF HIS CLASS
 MAKE SURE DI TO GET THEM AND PASS OUT BEFOREHAND
4. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CASE STUDY INVESTIGATION BRIEF BY THE COMPANY 1STSGT (SNELLING)

13-Aug
WK-6
T-30

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
8:00 - 9:00	1:00	REV	DI		SH		UTIL
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	1	UTIL
11:00 - 13:00	2:00	LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION (PRAC APP)	SI	TMI:0502	SA	2	UTIL

NOTES:

1. SOP INSTRUCTOR MAY USE THIS 2 HOUR BLOCK FOR CLASS, RUNNING THE DECK, AND PREVIOUS CLASS REVIEW
2. STUDENTS WILL CONDUCT PRACTICAL APPLICATION AND LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION WITH THEIR SQUAD INSTRUCTOR

14-Aug
WK-7

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

15-Aug

WK-7

T-31

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:15 - 9:15	2:00	SPIN/HITT TRAINING	PT	CC:0102	GYM	1	PT-2/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 11:30	2:00	TACTICAL CASUALTY COMBAT CARE I	BWT	BWT:0601	CR-2	2	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	5	UTIL
12:30 - 15:00	2:30	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		UTIL
15:00 - 16:00	1:00	1STSGT MENTOR TIME	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-2	3	UTIL
16:00 - 16:30	0:30	DEPOT REGULATIONS I PRE-EXAM REVIEW	SOP	SOP:1201X (RE)	CR-2	4	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH	6	UTIL
17:30 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
SEMPER FIT BRIEF AND [HITT] HIGH INTENSITY TACTICAL TRAINING
PT INSTRUCTOR COORDINATE WITH BONNIE, KEATING; CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-4428
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, AED, ICE AND TOWELS
UPPER BODY DEVELOPMENT
DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
2. IRF
3. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CASE STUDY INVESTIGATION BRIEF BY THE COMPANY 1STSGT (SGT GLASS)
4. THIS REVIEW IS TO PROVIDE AN OPPORTUNITY FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK ANY QUESTIONS
AND/OR REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION/ELABORATION ON DEPOT REGULATIONS I MATERIAL
5. CONFIRM WITH MUSEUM FOR STUDENT TOUR NEXT WEEK ON T-39
6. MAKE SURE STUDENTS PRINT OUT THEIR MBS FOR FITREP CLASS ON T-35

TRAINING SCHEDULE**16-Aug****WK-7****T-32**

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 6:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
6:00 - 8:00	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		UTIL
8:00 - 10:00	2:00	TACTICAL CASUALTY COMBAT CARE II	BWT	BWT:0601	CR-2	1	UTIL
10:00 - 11:30	1:30	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	PD		UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	CHIEF DRILL INSTRUCTOR PANEL	CI	SOP:0200	CR-1	2	UTIL
13:30 - 15:00	1:30	DEPOT REGULATION I EXAM	SOP	SOP:1201X (W)	CR-2	3,4	UTIL
15:00 - 15:30	0:30	POST DEPOT REGULATION I EXAM REVIEW	SOP	SOP:1201X (RE)	CR-2		UTIL
15:30 - 17:30	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		UTIL
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. IRF
2. DUTY SQUAD MAKE SURE TO SET CHAIRS ON THE CLASSROOM STAGE FOR THE CHIEF DRILL INSTRUCTORS
3. STUDENTS WILL BE SEATED IN CR-2 BY THE PRESCRIBED TIME WITH ONLY A FULL CANTEEN, INK STICK, LEAD STICK, AND MILITARY ID IN THEIR POSSESSION
4. A STUDENT FROM EACH SQUAD WILL FILL OUT AN EXAMINATION RATING FORM UPON COMPLETION OF THE EXAM

TRAINING SCHEDULE

17-Aug

WK-7

T-33

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF			
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:15 - 9:15	2:00	1/2 MI INTERVALS/CIRCUIT CRS	PT	CC:0102	TA-9	1	PT-2/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 10:30	1:00	FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT	CIV	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	UTIL
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	PACIFIC MARINE CREDIT UNION BRIEF	CIV	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
12:30 - 14:00	1:30	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH		UTIL
14:00 - 16:00	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/O ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0006	PD		UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	3	UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 1/2 MILE INTERALS (4) / CIRCUIT COURSE & AMMO CAN LIFTS
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORSEPMAN, VEHICLE W / (2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 DUTY SQUAD SET UP CIRCUIT COURSE
 DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. MR MCISAAC WILL GIVE 1ST BRIEF AT 0900 POC X 1204 THEN RETIRED SGTMAJ LONNIE LONG WILL BE GIVING THE BRIEF AT 1030. CONTACT # IS 760-672-2774
3. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL CONDUCT A 30 MINUTE GUIDED DISCUSSION ON FAMILY STABILITY AND COUNSEL AND REVIEW DI FOLDERS WITH STUDENTS

TRAINING SCHEDULE

18-Aug

WK-7

T-34

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 5:45	0:45	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
5:45 - 6:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 8:30	2:30	COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL V	PT/DI	CC:0105LP	SWIM TANK	1,2	PT-2/1
8:30 - 9:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	PD		SVC C
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	5,6	SVC C
12:00 - 14:30	2:30	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	SOP:0007	PD		SVC C
14:30 - 16:30	2:00	TACTICAL CASUALTY COMBAT CARE III	BWT	BWT:0601	CR-2	3	SVC C
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
17:30 - 19:00	1:30	LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION EVALUATION	SI	TMI:1502X (P)	SA	4	SVC C

NOTES:

1. SAFETY OFFICER MAY BE REQUIRED FOR SWIM QUALIFICATION (E-6 OR ABOVE)
(MAKE LIAISON WITH SWIM TANK CORPSMAN FOR SAFETY REQUIREMENT)
BLOOD ROSTERS AND EACH STUDENT'S BTR PRINTOUT REQUIRED FOR SWIM
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
ANY STUDENT NOT PARTICIPATING IN CWS SWIM WILL PARTICIPATE IN SWIM PT
DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
IDENTIFY ON SWIM ROSTERS ALL STUDENTS THAT ARE INTERMEDIATE OR HIGHER (MCIWS)
- * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL SUBMIT NAVMC 11209 TO BN S-3 FOR CONCLUSION OF SWIM QUAL INTO
THE STUDENTS' RECORD AND IDENTIFY THE PMC SWIMMERS FOR THE DI DRAFT
3. IRF
4. GUIDED DISCUSSION WILL BE EVALUATED BY SQUAD INSTRUCTORS
5. CONFIRM CORPSMAN SUPPORT FOR MIRAMAR LAKE RUN.
6. DUTY INSTRUCTOR CONTACT SGTMAJ RET FRANK PULLEY FOR T-39 MCA CLASS,
CONTACT NUMBER 951-595-5494

TRAINING SCHEDULE

19-Aug

WK-7

T-35

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH	5	PT-2/1
6:30 - 7:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MIRAMAR LAKE	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	MIRAMAR LAKE RUN	PT	CC:0102	MLA	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MCRD	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 11:00	1:30	LEAD A GUIDED DISCUSSION EVALUATION (CONT;)	SI	TMI:1502X (P)	SA	2	SVC C
11:00 - 11:30	0:30	DMO II	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	3	SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	4,8	SVC C
12:30 - 13:00	0:30	ASST. DIRECTOR FITNESS REPORT REVIEW	A-DIR	LEAD:0401	CR-1	6	SVC C
13:00 - 15:00	2:00	INDIVIDUAL DRILL MOVEMENTS W/ARMS	DM/SI	COD:0007	SA		SVC C
15:00 - 16:30	1:30	TEACHBACK BLOCK VI	DM/SI	COD:1003X (P)	PD/SH		SVC C
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	1STSGT GUIDED DISCUSSION	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1	7	SVC C
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
18:30 - 19:00	0:30	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1		SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
5-MILE SQUAD RUN TO HALFWAY PT./ RETURN RUN IN PAIRS
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE LOADED W/ (2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, AED & ICE
PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
2. GUIDED DISCUSSION WILL BE EVALUATED BY SQUAD INSTRUCTORS
3. DMO WILL BRIEF STUDENTS ON REQUIREMENTS FOR AN EASIER TRANSITION;CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-5369
4. 1STSGT NEEDS TO SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO SDA MONITOR TO FACILITATE WEB ORDERS FOR DMO PREPERATION BY STUDENTS
5. CONFIRM CORPSMAN SUPPORT FOR MIRAMAR LAKE RUN AND TO ATTEND CONFIRMATION BRIEF
6. STUDENTS WILL REVIEW FITNESS REPORT PROCEDURES
7. 1STSGT WILL CONDUCT A 1 HOUR GUIDED DISCUSSION ON SOCIAL MEDIA RESPONSIBILITY SET UP CLASS IN A SCHOOL CIRCLE
8. BWT INST EMAIL THE STAFF THE TIMELINE & SUPPORT YOU WILL NEED FOR CRUCIBLE OBSERVATION; EMAIL THE CHIEF OF THE COMPANIES THAT WE WILL BE OBSERVING WHILE AT WFTBN

TRAINING SCHEDULE
20-Aug
WK-7

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE
21-Aug
WK-8

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

22-Aug

WK-8

T-36

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-4/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-4/1
7:15 - 9:45	2:30	BAYONET ASSAULT COURSE THUNDER DOME & O' COURSE	PT	CC:0102	TA-3 TA-6	1	PT-4/1
9:45 - 10:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-4/1
10:00 - 12:30	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	3,4	UTIL
13:30 - 16:00	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	STANFORD EXPERIMENT DISCUSSION	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1	2	UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:00 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 BAYONET ASSAULT COURSE/THUNDER DOME/O' COURSE
 BLOUSE IN WARBAG WITH NO CHEVRONS, MOUTHPIECE IN POSSESSION
 DUTY SQUAD SET UP BAC
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEH W/(2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, ICE, AED, TOWELS, & CORPSMAN
 MAKE LIASON WITH ITC
 DUTY INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
2. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A BRIEF FROM THE 1STSGT REGARDING THE STANFORD PRISON EXPERIMENT
3. PT INSTRUCTOR WILL CONFIRM CORPSMAN SUPPORT FOR BALBOA PARK RUN
4. **STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CLASS/BRIEF ON T-49 ON CURRENT DRILL INSTRUCTOR MISCONDUCT DIRECTOR/ASSISTANT DIRECTOR COORDINATE WITH BN'S TO HAVE BN XO'S COME TO THIS PANEL**

TRAINING SCHEDULE

23-Aug

WK-8

T-37

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 8:30	1:30	UNIFORM INSPECTION VI	DI		PD	1	SVC A
8:30 - 8:45	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	CLOTHING		PT-2/1
8:45 - 11:45	3:00	PICK UP & GO I	UNIF	ADMIN:0902	CLOTHING	2	PT-2/1
11:45 - 12:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	4	UTIL
13:00 - 15:30	2:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM	COD:0001	PD		UTIL
15:30 - 17:00	1:30	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	3	UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. UNIFORM FOR INSPECTION IS SERVICE "A" WITH: CAMPAIGN COVER, DUTY BELT, RIBBONS, BADGES
2. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE 2ND UNIFORM FITTING
ENSURE A CLEAN PAIR OF SKIVVIES UNDERNEATH THEIR PT SHORT IS WORN FOR PROPER FITTING
STUDENTS WILL REQUIRE THEIR SEABAG
4. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL INSTRUCT STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE NEW
DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST TO INCLUDE 'RUNNING THE DECK'
5. CONFIRM 1STSGT ATTENDANCE FOR PANEL ON T-38

TRAINING SCHEDULE

24-Aug

WK-8

T-38

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:30 - 6:45	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:45 - 9:15	2:30	AGILITY PLYOMETRICS	PT	CC:0102	TA-7	1	PT-2/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 11:00	1:30	SACO/PTSD	DI/AC	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6,7	UTIL
12:00 - 12:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
12:15 - 14:45	2:30	PICK UP & GO II	CLOTHING	ADMIN:0902	PCO	3	PT-2/1
14:45 - 15:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
15:00 - 16:00	1:00	1STSGT LEADERSHIP PANEL	1STSGT	SOP:0200	CR-1	4	UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	5	UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 AGILITY PLYOMETRICS
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5- GALLON WATER CANS, AED, ICE AND TOWELS AND CORPSMAN
 PT INSTRUCTOR WILL GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A DEMONSTRATION BY THE DUTY SQUAD
2. DISCUSS ALCOHOLISM REFER TO SECTION V PAR. 3.D.4 OF POI (PSYCHOLOGICAL SCREENING)
 BRIEF GIVEN BY MRS. MARTINI AND 1STSGT, CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-1835
3. STUDENTS WILL PICK UP THEIR UNIFORMS WITH CHEVRONS AND BLOODSTRIPE SEWED ON;
 STUDENTS WILL REQUIRE THEIR SEABAG
 STUDENTS WILL BE ISSUED BATTALION T-SHIRTS AT THIS TIME
4. CHIEF INSTRUCTOR WILL ENSURE THAT THE COMPANY 1STSGTS NOMINATED
 FOR THIS PANEL HAVE BEEN PROVIDED A COURTESY REMINDER
5. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL ENSURE PACKAGES FOR MARINES SUBJECT TO THE T-40 BOARD ARE
 PREPARED AND REVIEWED BY CHIEF INSTRUCTOR
6. CONFIRM CORPSMAN SUPPORT AND CONFIRMATION BRIEF ATTENDANCE FOR BALBOA PARK RUN ON T-40
7. CONFIRM MUSEUM IS LOCKED ON FOR DIRECTOR DISCUSSION

TRAINING SCHEDULE

25-Aug

WK-8

T-39

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 5:45	0:45	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
5:45 - 6:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 8:45	2:45	COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL VI	PT/DI	CC:0105LP	POOL	1	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 9:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	MOTOR POOL		PT-2/1
9:15 - 10:45	1:30	SCOOTER LICENSING	CIV	SOP:0200	MOTOR POOL	2	PT-2/1
10:45 - 11:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
11:00 - 11:30	0:30	DEPOT REGULATIONS II PRE-EXAM REVIEW	DI	SOP:1201X(RE)	MH	3	PT-2/1
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:30 - 12:45	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	MUSEUM		UTIL
12:45 - 13:45	1:00	DIRECTOR'S LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION III	DIR	LEAD:0401	MUSEUM	4	UTIL
13:45 - 15:45	2:00	MUSEUM TOUR	MUS	ADMIN:0904	SH	5	UTIL
15:45 - 16:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DI	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
SAFETY OFFICER IS REQUIRED FOR SWIM QUALIFICATION (E-6 OR ABOVE)
MAKE LIAISON WITH SWIM TANK CORPSMAN FOR SAFETY REQUIREMENT
BLOOD ROSTERS
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED, AND TOWELS
ANY STUDENT NOT PARTICIPATING IN COMBAT WATER SURVIVAL SWIM WILL CONDUCT SWIM PT
IDENTIFY ON SWIM ROSTERS ALL STUDENTS THAT ARE INTERMEDIATE OR HIGHER (MCIWS)
* END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. THIS REVIEW IS TO PROVIDE AN OPPORTUNITY FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK ANY QUESTIONS
AND/OR REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION/ELABORATION ON DEPOT REGULATIONS II MATERIAL
3. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A PERIOD OF INSTRUCTION ON THE PROPER USE OF THE SCOOTER
AND BE LICENSED DUTY INSTRUCTOR ENSURE YOU BRING A MASTER CLASS ROSTER TO MOTOR POOL
4. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A BRIEF FROM THE DIRECTOR AT THE MUSEUM
5. STUDENT WILL RECEIVE A MUSEUM TOUR /BRIEF

TRAINING SCHEDULE

26-Aug

WK-8

T-40

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:30 - 7:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TO BALBOA PARK	PT	ADMIN:0901	BALBOA PARK		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	BALBOA PARK RUN	PT	CC:0102	BALBOA PARK	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	MOVEMENT TO MCRD	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:30 - 10:30	1:00	MARINE CORPS ASSOCIATION	CIV	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	SVC C
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	FAMILY ADVOCACY	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	3	SVC C
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	SPORTS MEDICINE BRIEF	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	4	SVC C
13:30 - 15:00	1:30	DEPOT REGULATION II EXAM	SOP	SOP:1201X (W)	CR-2	5	PT-2/1
15:00 - 15:30	0:30	POST DEPOT REGULATION II EXAM REVIEW	SOP	SOP:1201X (RE)	CR-2		PT-2/1
15:30 - 17:00	1:30	TEACHBACK BLOCK VII	DM/SI	COD:1003X (P)	PD/SH		SVC C
17:00 - 17:30	0:30	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1		SVC C

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED:
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
5-MILE SQUAD RUN
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, AED & ICE
PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
2. DUTY INSTRUCTOR CONTACT SGTMAJ RET FRANK PULLEY, CONTACT NUMBER 951-595-5494
3. SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO THE ADMIN CHIEF FOR ANNUAL TRAINING COMPLETION OF FAMILY ADVOCACY TRAINING (LOCAL SCHOOLS) GIVEN BY MRS. TEXIER; CONTACT NUMBER IS 4-1200
4. PT INSTRUCTOR WILL SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO THE ADMIN CHIEF FOR INJURY PREVENTION ANNUAL TRAINING COMPLETION, CODE (BF). CLASS WILL BE GIVEN BY SMIP PROGRAM MANAGER MELISSA MAHONEY AT 4-6248
5. STUDENTS WILL ENTER THE CLASSROOM WITH ONLY A ID CARD, PENCIL,CANTEEN IN THEIR POSSESSION

TRAINING SCHEDULE
27-Aug
WK-8

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE
28-Aug
WK-9

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

29-Aug

WK-9

T-41

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH	3	PT-2/1
6:30 - 6:45	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
6:45 - 8:45	2:00	FINAL PFT	PT	CC:1104X (P)	TA-11	1,2	PT-2/1
8:45 - 9:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		PT-2/1
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	WFTBN/BWT OVERVIEW	BWT	BWT:0600LP	CR-2	4	UTIL
9:30 - 10:15	0:45	WEAPON SAFETY	BWT	BWT:0607	CR-2	5	UTIL
10:15 - 12:00	1:45	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	BWT	SOP:0200	SH	6	UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
13:00 - 14:00	1:00	FIRE TEAM COMBAT FORMATIONS	BWT	BWT:0603	CR-2	5	UTIL
14:00 - 15:00	1:00	HAND & ARMS SIGNALS	BWT	BWT:0602	CR-2	5	UTIL
15:00 - 16:30	1:30	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	6	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:30 -	COMP	FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: (FINAL PFT)
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 PULLUPS, 3 MILE RUN, CRUNCHES
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GAL WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE A VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO THE ADMIN CHIEF FOR PFT SCORES TO BE SUBMITTED FOR INCLUSION IN THE STUDENTS RECORDS
3. BWT INST OR DESIGNATED INST WILL ARRIVE AT WFTBN ON MONDAY BEFORE DEPARTURE TO SIGN FOR THE BATTALION (6) RADIOS, (2) 4X4 AND (10) WATER JUGS
4. THE BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL BRIEF ON HOW WEAPONS AND FIELD TRAINING BATTALION CONDUCTS TRAINING AND HOW THE RECRUIT TRAINING COMPANIES EXECUTE BASIC WARRIOR TRAINING AND THE CRUCIBLE
5. IRF
6. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL INSTRUCT STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE NEW DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST TO INCLUDE 'RUNNING THE DECK'

TRAINING SCHEDULE

30-Aug

WK-9

T-42

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
4:30 - 5:30	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		MCRD	1	UTIL
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	MVMT TO WFTBN	DI	ADMIN:0901	MCRD WFTBN		UTIL
6:30 - 7:30	1:00	BWT/HOUSE SET UP	DI	BWT:0608	SQUADBAY	2,3	UTIL
7:30 - 11:30	4:00	ADMIN MOVEMENT/HIKE	DI	ADMIN:0901	WFTBN	4	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	BWT/DI		CHOWHALL		UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	PMI/BN GUNNER BRIEF CIRCLES OVERVIEW	BWT/DI	BWT:0608	PMI SHACK	5, 6	UTIL
13:30 - 14:30	1:00	TOPOGRAPHICAL MAP	FI	BWT:0606	PMI SHACK	7	UTIL
14:30 - 15:30	1:00	BUDDY TEAM & FIRE TEAM MOVEMENT TECHNIQUES	FI	BWT:0605	PMI SHACK	7	UTIL
15:30 - 16:30	1:00	INDIVIDUAL MOVEMENT TECHNIQUES	FI	BWT:0604	PMI SHACK	7	UTIL
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	BWT/DI		CHOWHALL		UTIL
17:30 - 18:30	1:00	MVMT TO RANGE 501	BWT/DI	ADMIN:0901	R 501		UTIL
18:30 - 20:30	2:00	RO CONDUCT OF CRUCIBLE PREP,BDR	BWT/DI	BWT:0608	R 501	8,9	UTIL
20:30 - 21:30	1:00	MVMT TO SQUAD BAY	BWT/DI	ADMIN:0901	SQUADBAY		UTIL
21:30 - 22:30	1:00	EVENING BDR/SLEEP	BWT/DI	SOP:0200	SQUADBAY		UTIL

NOTES:

2. STUDENTS WILL SET UP SQUADBAY IN RECRUIT BARRACKS AT EDSON RANGE
3. BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL ENSURE THAT A FIRE DRILL IS CONDUCTED DURING THIS TIME
4. CLASS WILL MAKE AN ADMINISTRATIVE MOVEMENT TO/FROM RANGE 505
5. STUDENTS WILL OBSERVE THE CONDUCT OF THE CONFIDENCE CHAMBER. BWT INSTRUCTOR SUBMIT A CLASS ROSTER TO WFTBN S-3 FOR ANNUAL GAS CHAMBER QUALIFICATION
6. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A BRIEF FROM PMI SNCOIC AND/OR BATTALION GUNNER ON FIRING AND LINE OUT PROCEDURES
7. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A BRIEF FROM FIELD TRAINING COMPANY OVER MATERIAL COVERED WITH RECRUITS DURING FIELD SKILLS REVIEW
8. STUDENTS WILL BE SHOWN ALL AREAS PERTINENT TO DUTIES AS A NEW DRILL INSTRUCTOR ABOARD EDSON RANGE
9. THE BWT INSTRUCTOR, WITH DUTY INSTRUCTOR WILL TAKE STUDENTS TO WATCH FIELD PREP AND BDR BEFORE THE CRUCIBLE. BWT INSTRUCTOR WILL COORDINATE BRIEF FROM CRUCIBLE COMPANY TO ALLOW STUDENTS TO SPEAK WITH A NEW DI ABOUT HIS EXPERIENCES OBSERVATION AND SUPERVISION OF THE CRUCIBLE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

31-Aug

WK-9

T-43

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
4:30 - 5:30	1:00	REVEILLE	DI		SQUADBAY		UTIL
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	CHOW	DI		CHOWHALL		UTIL
6:30 - 11:00	4:30	CRUCIBLE OBSERVATION	DI	SOP:0200	RANGE 501	1,2	UTIL
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	CHOW	DI		CHOWHALL		UTIL
12:00 - 16:30	4:30	CRUCIBLE OBSERVATION	DI	SOP:0200	RANGE 505	1,2	UTIL
16:30 - 17:00	0:30	MOVEMENT TO SQUADBAY	DI	ADMIN:0901	WFTBN		UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	CHOW	DI		CHOWHALL		UTIL
18:00 - 19:00	1:00	HIKE PREPARATION	DI	SOP:0200	SQUADBAY	3	UTIL
19:00 - 20:30	1:30	CRUCIBLE CRITIQUE	SI	BWT:0608	SQUADBAY		UTIL
20:30 - 21:30	1:00	EVENING BDR/SLEEP	DI	SOP:0200	SQUADBAY		UTIL

NOTES:

1. STUDENTS WILL EAT THROUGHOUT THE CRUCIBLE AT THEIR OWN DISCRETION
2. STUDENTS WILL WALK THE CRUCIBLE WITH ASSIGNED SQUAD INSTRUCTOR FOR OBSERVATION AND SUPERVISION OF THE CRUCIBLE.
3. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL PROVIDE AN AFTER ACTION REPORT AT THE CONCLUSION OF THE CRUCIBLE AT END OF DAY RETURN TO MAINSIDE BARRACKS TO HYGIENE & SLEEP

TRAINING SCHEDULE

1-Sep

WK-9

T-44

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
2:00	- 2:30	:30	REVEILLE	DI	OSCAR-1		UTIL
2:30	- 8:00	4:30	CRUCIBLE HIKE/MOH CITATION READING	DI	SOP:0200	OSCAR-1	UTIL
8:00	- 9:00	1:00	MVMT TO BARRACKS/HYGIENE	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SQUADBAY	UTIL
9:00	- 10:00	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	1,2 UTIL
10:00	- 12:00	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	UTIL
12:00	- 13:00	1:00	MVMT TO MCRD	DI	ADMIN:0901	MCRD	3 UTIL
13:00	- 17:00	4:00	REST	BWT	ADMIN:0901	SH	4 PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. THE STUDENTS WILL OBSERVE THE NEW MARINES CONDUCT HIKE RECOVERY
2. THE DIRECTOR WILL GIVE A TIE IN VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE HIKE EVENT
3. DM WILL ENSURE THEATER IS RESERVED
4. CRUCIBLE RECOVERY, DURING THIS TIME STUDENTS WILL SLEEP FOR 4HRS IN THE DI SCHOOL SQUAD BAY, AND THEN GET SECURED

TRAINING SCHEDULE

2-Sep

WK-9

T-45

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	1	UTIL
9:00 - 9:30	0:30	PAO MEDIA BRIEF	PAO	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	SVC C
9:30 - 10:00	:30	BWT PRE-EXAM REVIEW	SI	BWT:1601X (RE)	CR-2	3	SVC C
10:00 - 10:30	0:30	UNIT LEADER BRIEF	DM/SI	COD:0001	CR-2	4	SVC C
10:30 - 12:00	1:30	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	1	UTIL
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6	SVC C
13:00 - 13:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		SVC C
13:15 - 15:15	2:00	GRAD PRACTICE	DM/SI	ADMIN:0905	THEATER	5	SVC C
15:15 - 15:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH		SVC C
15:30 - 17:00	1:30	DRILL A PLATOON	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD		SVC C
17:00 - 17:30	0:30	HOLIDAY SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-1		SVC C

NOTES:

1. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL INSTRUCT STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE NEW DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST TO INCLUDE 'RUNNING THE DECK'
2. THIS BRIEF IS AN OVERVIEW OF WHAT STUDENTS CAN EXPECT WHEN DEALING WITH PAO SITUATIONS PAO EXT; 254-8726
3. THIS REVIEW IS FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK QUESTIONS AND TO PROVIDE THE STUDENTS WITH AN OVERVIEW OF MATERIAL THAT WILL BE COVERED IN THE BWT EXAMINATION
4. THE DM WILL BRIEF THE STUDENTS ON HOW THE UNIT LEADER EVALUATION WILL BE EXECUTED AND AFFORD THE STUDENTS TO ASK QUESTIONS FOR CLARIFICATION, SQUAD INSTRUCTORS ARE REQUIRED TO BE PRESENT FOR THIS REVIEW
5. DM WILL ENSURE THE THEATER IS AVAILABLE
6. UNIFORM INSTRUCTOR COORDINATE WITH A RECRUIT TRAINING COMPANY TO GET RIFLES FOR THE CLASS PHOTO DISPLAY

TRAINING SCHEDULE
3-Sep
WK-9

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	HOLIDAY ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE
4-Sep
WK-10

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	HOLIDAY ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

5-Sep

WK-10

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	HOLIDAY ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

6-Sep

WK-10

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	HOLIDAY ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

7-Sep

WK-10

T-46

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:30 - 6:30	1:00	MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:30 - 8:00	1:30	DIRECTOR'S INSPECTION	STAFF	GMS:1301X (P)	PD	1	SVC A
8:00 - 9:30	1:30	CLASS PHOTOS	STAFF	ADMIN:0902	REC PX	2	SVC A
9:30 - 10:30	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA		UTIL
10:30 - 12:30	2:00	COD PERFORMANCE EVAL I	DM/SI	COD:1001X (P)	PD	3	UTIL
12:30 - 13:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH	6	UTIL
13:30 - 14:30	1:00	BWT WRITEN EXAM	BWT	BWT:1601X (W)	CR-2	4	PT-2/1
14:30 - 15:00	0:30	BWT POST-EXAM REVIEW	BWT	BWT:1601X (RE)	CR-2	5	PT-2/1
15:00 - 17:00	2:00	COD PERFORMANCE EVAL II	DM/SI	COD:1001X (P)	PD	3	UTIL
17:00 - 18:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
18:00 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH		PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. THE UNIFORM FOR INSPECTION WILL BE SERVICE ALPHAS W/RIBBONS, BADGES, CAMPAIGN COVERS AND DUTY BELTS. ENSURE STUDENTS HAVE PHOTO SLIPS FILLED OUT
2. UPON COMPLETION OF CLASS/SQUAD PICTURES ALL STUDENTS WILL PROCEED TO COMBAT CAMERA FOR COMMAND BOARD PHOTOS
3. STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED AS A UNIT LEADER; THE EVALUATION WILL BE CONDUCTED IN SVC C UNIFORM; WHEN NOT BEING EVALUATED STUDENTS WILL BE IN UNIFORM OF THE DAY
4. STUDENTS WILL ENTER THE CLASSROOM WITH ONLY A ID CARD, PENCIL, CANTEEN IN THEIR POSSESSION
5. A STUDENT FROM EACH SQUAD WILL FILL OUT AN EXAMINATION RATING FORM UPON COMPLETION OF THE EXAM
6. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS ENSURE YOU UPDATE HOLIDAY ACCIDENT REDUCTION PLAN (HARP) FORMS BY T-48

TRAINING SCHEDULE

8-Sep

WK-10

T-47

THURSDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		SVC C
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	SQUAD BAY PROCEDURES (RUNNING THE DECK)	SOP	SOP:0200	SH	1	UTIL
9:00 - 11:00	2:00	COD PERFORMANCE EVAL III	DM/SI	COD:1001X (P)	PD	2	SVC C
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C
12:00 - 14:00	2:00	COD PERFORMANCE EVAL IV	DM/SI	COD:1001X (P)	PD	2	SVC C
14:00 - 14:30	0:30	COD WRITEN EXAM REVIEW	DM	COD:1000X (RE)	CR-2	3	SVC C
14:30 - 16:30	2:00	GRAD PRACTICE	DM/SI	ADMIN:0905	CR-2	4	SVC C
16:30 - 17:30	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		SVC C

NOTES:

1. THE SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL INSTRUCT STUDENTS IN AREAS PERTAINING TO THE NEW DRILL INSTRUCTOR CHECKLIST TO INCLUDE 'RUNNING THE DECK'
2. STUDENTS WILL BE EVALUATED AS A UNIT LEADER; THE EVALUATION WILL BE CONDUCTED IN SVC C UNIFORM; WHEN NOT BEING EVALUATED STUDENTS WILL BE IN UNIFORM OF THE DAY
3. THIS REVIEW IS TO PROVIDE AN OPPORTUNITY FOR THE STUDENTS TO ASK ANY QUESTIONS AND/OR REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION/ELABORATION ON COD TEST MATERIAL
4. GRADUATION PRACTICE WILL TAKE PLACE IN CR-2, STUDENTS WILL HAVE THEIR CAMPAIGN COVERS MARKED AND PRESENT FOR THIS PRACTICE

TRAINING SCHEDULE

9-Sep

WK-10

T-48

FRIDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH	PT-5/1
7:00 - 7:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH	1 PT-5/1
7:15 - 9:15	2:00	FINAL CFT	PT	CC:1103X (P)	MH	PT-5/1
9:15 - 9:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH/AIP	PT-5/1
9:30 - 11:00	1:30	COD WRITTEN EXAM	DM	COD:1000X (W)	CR-2	2 PT-2/1
11:00 - 12:00	1:00	POST COD WRITTEN EXAM REVIEW	DM	COD:1000X (RE)	CR-2	3 PT-2/1
12:00 - 13:00	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		SH/AIP	SVC C
13:00 - 13:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	PT	ADMIN:0901	SH	PT-2/1
13:15 - 14:45	1:30	OP ISSUE	UNIF	ADMIN:0902	PCO	4 PT-2/1
14:45 - 15:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	UNIF	ADMIN:0901	SH	PT-2/1
15:00 - 15:15	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DM	ADMIN:0901	THEATER	SVC C
15:15 - 16:45	1:30	GRAD PRACTICE	DM/SI	ADMIN:0905	THEATER	5 SVC C
16:45 - 17:00	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DM	ADMIN:0901	SH	SVC C
17:00 - 17:30	0:30	WEEKEND SAFETY BRIEF	1STSGT	LEAD:0401	CR-2	PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: (FINAL CFT)
 DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
 COMBAT FITNESS TEST
 SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
 PT INSTRUCTOR GIVE VBT UPON COMPLETION OF THE PT EVENT
 * END OF EVENT MAY FLUCTUATE DEPENDING ON THE SIZE OF THE CLASS
2. STUDENTS WILL BE SEATED IN CR-2 BY THE PRESCRIBED TIME WITH ONLY A FULL CANTEEN,
 INK STICK, LED-STICK, AND MILITARY ID IN THEIR POSSESSION
3. A STUDENT FROM EACH SQUAD WILL FILL OUT AN EXAMINATION RATING FORM UPON COMPLETION
 OF THE EXAM
4. UNIFORM INSTRUCTOR CAN USE THIS TIME FOR ANY LAST MINUTE OR ADDITIONAL UNIFORM ISSUES
 STUDENTS WILL PICK UP THEIR UNIFORMS WITH CHEVRONS AND BLOODSTRIPE SEWED ON;
 STUDENTS WILL REQUIRE THEIR SEABAG
 STUDENTS WILL BE ISSUED BATTALION T-SHIRTS AT THIS TIME

TRAINING SCHEDULE
10-Sep
WK-10

SATURDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE
11-Sep
WK-11

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
0:00 - 23:59	23:59	WEEKEND ROUTINE	DI		SH/MH		N/A

TRAINING SCHEDULE

12-Sep

WK-11

T-49

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		UTIL
7:00 - 8:00	1:00	SQUAD INSTRUCTOR TIME	SI	LEAD:0401	SA	1	UTIL
8:00 - 8:30	0:30	CHAPLAINS BRIEF	CHAP	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	2	UTIL
8:30 - 8:45	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DM	ADMIN:0901	THEATER		UTIL
8:45 - 10:15	1:30	GRAD PRACTICE	DM/SI	ADMIN:0905	THEATER	3	UTIL
10:15 - 10:30	0:15	MOVEMENT TIME	DM	ADMIN:0901	SH		UTIL
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	CURRENT MISCONDUCT CASE STUDY	CI	LEAD:0401	CR-1	4	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:30 - 14:00	1:30	COD REMEDIATION	DM/SI	COD:0001	PD	5	UTIL
14:00 - 15:00	1:00	RTO CONDUCT BRIEF	SOP/ 1STSGT	SOP:0200	CR-1	6	UTIL
15:00 - 21:30	6:30	RTO	SOP	SOP:0200	RTR	7,8	UTIL

NOTES:

1. SQUAD INSTRUCTORS WILL COVER ITEMS THAT MAY ARISE DURING RTO
2. DUTY INSTRUCTOR CONTACT CHAPLAIN TO CONFIRM BRIEF TIME
STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A BRIEF FROM THE REGIMENTAL CHAPLAIN
3. STUDENTS WILL MARCH TO THEATER; DRILL MASTER AND ALL NEW INSTRUCTORS ARE THE ONLY REQUIRED PERSONNEL FOR THIS GRADUATION PRACTICE
4. STUDENTS WILL RECEIVE A CLASS/BRIEF ON CURRENT DRILL INSTRUCTOR MISCONDUCT ABOARD MCRDSD
DIRECTOR/ASSISTANT DIRECTOR WILL COORDINATE WITH BN'S TO HAVE A BN XO'S COME TO THIS PANEL
5. THIS PERIOD IS RESERVED FOR THOSE STUDENTS WHO FAILED THEIR INITIAL UNIT LEADER EVALUATION;
THE DM WILL DETERMINE THE BREAKDOWN OF STUDENTS PER SQUAD. STUDENT'S FILLING IN AS PLATOON MEMBERS WILL BE IN THE UTILITY UNIFORM.
6. SOP INSTRUCTOR WILL CONDUCT THE RTO BRIEF DURING THIS TIME AND BWT INSTRUCTOR FOR WFTBN BRIEF
7. STUDENTS WILL ENSURE THEY MATCH THEIR UNIFORM OF THE DAY WITH THE TRAINING COMPANY
8. STUDENTS WILL TAKE ALL NECESSARY GEAR WITH THEM TO THE TRAINING COMPANY AND WILL ONLY RETURN TO DRILL INSTRUCTOR SCHOOL FOR THE 21:30 FORMATION

TRAINING SCHEDULE
13-SEP THROUGH 17-SEP
WK-11
T-50 THROUGH T-54

TUE - SAT	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
4:30 - 21:30	17:00	RTO	SOP	SOP:0200	RTR	1,2	UOD

NOTES:

1. STUDENTS WILL TAKE ALL NECESSARY GEAR WITH THEM TO THE TRAINING COMPANY AND WILL ONLY RETURN TO DRILL INSTRUCTOR SCHOOL FOR 21:30 FORMATION
2. STUDENTS WILL ENSURE TO MATCH UNIFORM OF THE DAY WITH TRAINING COMPANY

TRAINING SCHEDULE
18-Sep
WK-12
T-55

SUNDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
5:00 - 6:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
6:00 - 9:00	3:00	RTO DEBRIEF	SOP	SOP:0200	CR-2	1,2	PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. TURN IN COMPLETED RTO EVALUATION SHEET TO SOP INSTRUCTOR
2. SAFETY BRIEF CONDUCTED BY SOP INSTRUCTOR

TRAINING SCHEDULE

19-Sep

WK-12

T-56

MONDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH		PT-2/1
7:00 - 9:00	2:00	COMMANDING GENERAL'S MOTO RUN	STAFF	CC:0102	SH/RTR	1	PT-2/1
9:00 - 10:00	1:00	CPAC III	CIV	ADMIN:0900	CR-1	2	UTIL
10:00 - 12:00	2:00	MCCS LUNCH BRIEF	DI	ADMIN:0903	CR-1	3	UTIL
12:00 - 14:00	2:00	GRADUATION PRACTICE	DM	ADMIN:0905	THEATRE	4	UTIL
14:00 - 15:00	1:00	BN SGTMAJ LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION	CI	ADMIN:0904	CR-1	5	UTIL
15:00 - 16:00	1:00	BN COMMANDERS LEADERSHIP DISCUSSION	CI	ADMIN:0904	CR-1	5	UTIL
16:00 - 17:00	1:00	EVENING MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
17:00 - COMP		FIELD DAY	DI		SH	6	PT-2/1

NOTES:

1. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: COMMANDING GENERALS MOTIVATION RUN
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
FORMATION IN ORDER OF BATTALION, RED, YELLOW THEN BLUE
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
2. CPAC WILL CONDUCT THE LAST PROOFING OF ORDERS & DLA FORMS
3. MCCS WILL HOST A LUNCH ALONG WITH MISCELLANEOUS BRIEFS FOR STUDENTS IN CR 1
4. STUDENTS WILL MARCH TO THE THEATRE / ALL STAFF WILL BE AT THIS PRACTICE
5. STUDENTS WILL HAVE NOTE TAKING MATERIAL IN THEIR POSSESSION
6. DUTY INSTRUCTOR ENSURE ISSUED COAT HANGERS ARE COLLECTED

TRAINING SCHEDULE

20-Sep

WK-12

T-57

TUESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH	1, 4	PT-2/1
7:00 - 8:30	1:30	RTR SGTMAJ MOTO RUN	STAFF	CC:0102	MCRD	2	PT-2/1
8:30 - 10:30	2:00	GRADUATION PRACTICE	DM	ADMIN:0905	THEATRE		UTIL
10:30 - 11:30	1:00	RTR CO/SGTMAJ LEADERDRSHP DISCUSSION	STAFF	ADMIN:0904	CR-1	3, 6	UTIL
11:30 - 12:30	1:00	NOON MEAL	DI		MH		UTIL
12:30 - 14:00	1:30	EVENING BDR/CHANGEOVER PCA (IPAC)	DI/IPAC	ADMIN:0900	SH	5, 7	PT-2/1
17:00 - 20:30	3:30	PROFESSIONAL DINNER	STAFF	ADMIN:0905	BAYVIEW		CIV

NOTES:

1. CLASS COMMANDER SUBMIT A ROSTER TO THE CHIEF INSTRUCTOR OF ALL BEQ ROOMS CLOSED OUT
2. PT TO BE CONDUCTED: RTR SGTMAJ MOTIVATION RUN
DYNAMIC WARM-UP EXERCISES
FORMATION IN ORDER OF BATTALION, RED, YELLOW THEN BLUE
SAFETY REQUIREMENTS: CORPSMAN, VEHICLE W/(2) 5-GALLON WATER CANS, ICE, AED & TOWELS
3. STUDENTS WILL HAVE NOTE TAKING MATERIAL IN THEIR POSSESSION
4. END OF COURSE CRITIQUES WILL BE COMPLETED
5. PCA MARINES WILL NEED TO SEE MR. PRICE AT IPAC AT 1300
6. DISTRIBUTE COL ERICKSON'S "E'S" TO CLASS IN ADVANCE AND DEFINITION OF "SERVANT LEADERSHIP"
7. STUDENTS WILL BE SECURED EARLY TO SUPPORT SPOUSES DISCOVERY NIGHT WITH RTR CO'S & FRO TO INCLUDE DI SCHOOL 1STSGT AND DIRECTOR TIME WILL BE AT 1700 AT THE RTR FAMILY LOUNGE LOCATION MAY CHANGE DEPENDING ON NUMBER OF PERSONNEL ATTENDING

TRAINING SCHEDULE

21-Sep

WK-12

GRADUATION

WEDNESDAY	TIME	ACTIVITY	INSTR	REF	LOCATION	NOTES	UNIF
6:00 - 7:00	1:00	REV/CLEAN-UP/MORNING MEAL	DI		SH/MH	1	UTIL
7:00 - 8:00	1:00	GRADUATION SET-UP	DM	ADMIN:0905	THEATRE		UTIL
8:00 - 9:00	1:00	GRADUATION PRACTICE	STAFF	ADMIN:0905	CR-1	2	UTIL
9:00 - 10:00	1:00	GRADUATION PREP TIME	SI	ADMIN:0905	SA		UTIL
10:00 - GRAD		GRADUATION	STAFF	ADMIN:0905	THEATRE	3	SVC C

NOTES:

1. THE DUTY INSTRUCTOR WILL CONDUCT A CLEAN UP WALK THROUGH OF THE SCHOOL HOUSE WITH THE CLASS AND ENSURE THE SQUAD BAY IS EMPTY FROM STUDENT BELONGINGS
2. STUDENTS WILL BRING CAMPAIGN COVERS
3. SVC C W/RIBBONS, NAME TAG, CAMPAIGN COVERS, AND DUTY BELTS